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Prince Gentil, in flight from the destruction of his father’s royal palace, finds a berth as crew on the yacht
Kresala, along with his friend Alick. Drama and adventure await them as they set sail for the Winter Isles far
off across the Northern Ocean.

But the skipper Nestor, and his mate, Gorka, are themselves refugees from a troubled past, and this is no
ordinary voyage. To add to the mystery, they are embarking on a secret mission involving a hidden
passenger on the boat whom Nestor calls his “cargo”.

Gentil and Alick have much to learn as they sail through storm and becalming, and face dangers not only
from the elements but from wreckers and smugglers. Soon, too, the enchanting figure of Itxaso enters
Gentil’s life and together they must confront the terrifying threats that lie at the end of the Kresala’s mission.

The Voyage of the Kresala is the fourth book in the series The Seven Songs. Previous titles available on
Amazon Kindle are King Abba, and Behind the Mountain. See the dedicated website www.kingabba.com for
more details.

C J Moore has worked as a journalist, teacher and editor in many different countries, and now spends his
time between Scotland, Switzerland and Spain.The Seven Songs is his main writing project with more titles
to follow as the series develops.

See also C J Moore's author pages on Amazon and on Goodreads.
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From reader reviews:

Leslie Heidelberg:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This The Voyage of the Kresala (The Seven Songs Book 4) book is readable by
means of you who hate those straight word style. You will find the information here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you.
The writer of The Voyage of the Kresala (The Seven Songs Book 4) content conveys objective easily to
understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different as it. So , do you continue to thinking The Voyage of the Kresala (The Seven Songs Book 4) is not
loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Edward Salazar:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Voyage of the Kresala (The Seven
Songs Book 4), it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still desire to miss it? What
kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named
reading friends.

Janet Steele:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Voyage of the Kresala (The
Seven Songs Book 4) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Pearl Young:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Voyage of the Kresala (The Seven
Songs Book 4) can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date,
spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have
than the others?
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