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Recent research has emphasized that socially transmitted information may affect both the gene pool and the
phenotypes of individuals and populations, and that an improved understanding of evolutionary issues is
beneficial to those working towards the improvement of human health. Equally, an improved awareness of
how human behavior influences health and reproductive fitness is starting to shed new light on the processes
that shape the evolution of human behavior and the human mind.

Focusing directly on these emerging trends, Social Information Transmission and Human Biology bridges
the gap between primarily theoretical work undertaken by those with evolutionary interests and biomedical
work undertaken by those dealing with practical issues in human health and demographics. Incorporating
papers from a symposium organized under the auspices of the UK Society for the Study of Human Biology,
this volume merges the perspectives of internationally renowned evolutionary and theoretical biologists,
zoologists, anthropologists, archaeologists, psychologists, and medical researchers whose work is linked by
common themes addressing how information is transmitted socially and how its transmission influences both
immediate and evolutionary biological outcomes.

Emphasizes the diverse ways in which socially transmitted information impacts on
human biology

To illustrate these themes, the chapters draw on models and data ranging from observations on chimpanzee
populations in the wild and on the human archaeological record, to studies of contemporary humans in both
developing and industrialized countries. Taking a broad approach, many of the chapters address areas of
behavior that are familiar to scientists in particular fields, but do so using a variety of cross-disciplinary
perspectives, which will prove stimulating for researchers in a range of academic subject areas, while helping
to facilitate closer collaboration between biological and social scientists.
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From reader reviews:

Johanna Garrett:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be consider if those
information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then
you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take Social Information Transmission and Human Biology (Society for the
Study of Human Biology) as your daily resource information.

Rosa Flint:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy your
short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that need more time to
be read. Social Information Transmission and Human Biology (Society for the Study of Human Biology) can
be your answer since it can be read by you actually who have those short time problems.

Marian Storie:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to your account is Social Information Transmission and Human Biology (Society for the
Study of Human Biology) this publication consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now.
This kind of book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
value to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some exploration when he makes this
book. That's why this book suited all of you.

John McKeever:

Beside this particular Social Information Transmission and Human Biology (Society for the Study of Human
Biology) in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an
previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Social Information Transmission and
Human Biology (Society for the Study of Human Biology) because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book and also read it from today!
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