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These four volumes (CCIS 297, 298, 299, 300) constitute the proceedings of the 14th International
Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in Knowledge-Based Systems,
IPMU 2012, held in Catania, Italy, in July 2012. The 258 revised full papers presented together with six
invited talks were carefully reviewed and selected from numerous submissions. The papers are organized in
topical sections on fuzzy machine learning and on-line modeling; computing with words and decision
making; soft computing in computer vision; rough sets and complex data analysis: theory and applications;
intelligent databases and information system; information fusion systems; philosophical and methodological
aspects of soft computing; basic issues in rough sets; 40th anniversary of the measures of fuziness; SPS11
uncertainty in profiling systems and applications; handling uncertainty with copulas; formal methods to deal
with uncertainty of many-valued events; linguistic summarization and description of data; fuzzy
implications: theory and applications; sensing and data mining for teaching and learning; theory and
applications of intuitionistic fuzzy sets; approximate aspects of data mining and database analytics; fuzzy
numbers and their applications; information processing and management of uncertainty in knowledge-based
systems; aggregation functions; imprecise probabilities; probabilistic graphical models with imprecision:
theory and applications; belief function theory: basics and/or applications; fuzzy uncertainty in economics
and business; new trends in De Finetti's approach; fuzzy measures and integrals; multi criteria decision
making; uncertainty in privacy and security; uncertainty in the spirit of Pietro Benvenuti; coopetition; game
theory; probabilistic approach.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Mundo:

In other case, little folks like to read book Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV: 14th
International Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer and
Information Science). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know
about how is important any book Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV: 14th International
Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer and Information
Science). You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly
because from book you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will
end up known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a
book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to
the library. Let's go through.

Heather Roberts:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important normally. The book Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV: 14th
International Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer and
Information Science) has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take
more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The book Advances in Computational
Intelligence, Part IV: 14th International Conference on Information Processing and Management of
Uncertainty in ... in Computer and Information Science) is not only giving you a lot more new information
but also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book.
Try to make relationship with all the book Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV: 14th
International Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer and
Information Science). You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Willard Edwards:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking Advances in Computational
Intelligence, Part IV: 14th International Conference on Information Processing and Management of
Uncertainty in ... in Computer and Information Science) that give your fun preference will be satisfied
through reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for people to know
world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading
practice only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for
every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick Advances in Computational
Intelligence, Part IV: 14th International Conference on Information Processing and Management of
Uncertainty in ... in Computer and Information Science) become your personal starter.



David Wilkens:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you could have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV:
14th International Conference on Information Processing and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer
and Information Science) can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you
have point that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one
of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than some other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have
Advances in Computational Intelligence, Part IV: 14th International Conference on Information Processing
and Management of Uncertainty in ... in Computer and Information Science).
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