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The African Union (AU) is a continental organization that comprises every African state except for
Morocco, is indeed a pioneering undertaking. Its ambitious aim is to integrate all member states, with the
ultimate goal of forming the United States of Africa. Despite several attempts to build a union, the AU has
remained an intergovernmental organization, one reason being a perceived unwillingness of the AU states to
pool their national sovereignties.

This study seeks to comprehend why Africa’s integration process has not moved towards a supranational
organization, using a novel approach. It shifts the usual perspective away from the organization level and
provides the first comprehensive and systematic analysis of the AU from the perspective of the states
themselves. It includes 8 comprehensive case studies: Algeria, Burkina Faso, Ethiopia, Mauritius, South
African, Swaziland, Uganda and Zimbabwe to help understand their foreign policy and provide key insights
into why they are (un)willing to yield sovereignty.

This work will be of great interest to students and scholars of African politics, international relations and
international organizations.
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From reader reviews:

Sylvia Healey:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question because just
their can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Integrating Africa:
Decolonization's Legacies, Sovereignty and the African Union (Global Institutions) to read.

Bessie Papp:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book this improve
your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you read, if you want
drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read one using theme
for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Integrating Africa: Decolonization's Legacies, Sovereignty
and the African Union (Global Institutions) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Judith Carter:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name Integrating
Africa: Decolonization's Legacies, Sovereignty and the African Union (Global Institutions) suitable to you?
Often the book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book untitled Integrating Africa:
Decolonization's Legacies, Sovereignty and the African Union (Global Institutions)is the main one of several
books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read
this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the
simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lots
of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world with this book.

Beverly Hill:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Integrating Africa: Decolonization's Legacies,
Sovereignty and the African Union (Global Institutions) can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you
know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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