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State and Trends of the Carbon Market 2004 examines the status of the emerging market for greenhouse
gases emissions allowances and greenhouse gases emission reduction projects ¡X the so-called "carbon
market." Based on a database of 354 transactions, this study shows that the market has been growing steadily
over the past years, with demand still heavily concentrated and supply shifting from Latin America to Asia.
It also explores the determinants of the price of carbon, showing that, in the absence of a standard contract
for the purchase of emission reductions, the structure of the transaction has a strong impact on the price. This
study finds that the carbon market is growing steadily. A total of 64 million metric tones of carbon dioxide
equivalent (tCO2e) has been exchanged through projects from January to May 2004, nearly as much as
during the whole year 2003 (78 million). Second, the demand for emission reductions remains heavily
concentrated, with a few EU Governments and Japanese firms the largest buyers. Third, Asia is now the
largest supplier of emission reductions, followed by Latin America, developed economies, and Eastern
Europe. Last, prices of project-based emission reductions in early 2004 have remained essentially stable
compared with 2003. In the absence of a standard contract, these prices strongly depend on the structure of
the transaction, notably risk-sharing between buyers and sellers.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Brown:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a
while is reading. Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this State And Trends Of
The Carbon Market 2004 (World Bank Working Papers) book as starter and daily reading guide. Why,
because this book is more than just a book.

Samara Reed:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you
want experience happy read one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the State And
Trends Of The Carbon Market 2004 (World Bank Working Papers) is kind of publication which is giving the
reader unpredictable experience.

Hayden Wolfe:

The book State And Trends Of The Carbon Market 2004 (World Bank Working Papers) has a lot details on
it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can get the
point easily after perusing this book.

Carol Ton:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
large amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is State And Trends Of The Carbon Market 2004 (World Bank Working Papers).
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