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Gerald Woodman, an Englishman and an Orthodox Jew, came to American penniless and hungry for the
good life. By 1980 he had gained and lost two fortunes, had built his plastics company into a cash cow that
supported his large extended family in great luxury. Killed in 1985 along with his wife Vera, the police
asked Vera's sister if the Woodmans had any enemies, she replied , 'Yes, their sons.' Family Blood follows
the investigation of these murders and reveals a story of the American Dream gone wrong. Gerald, behind
his facade of charm, piety and filial warmth, was a ruthless, amoral businessman, a philandering husband, a
ferociously abusive father, and a compulsive gambler. His sons, Neil and Stewart, inherited his charm and
business principles. This is the story of the hidden dynamics of an outwardly successful American family
that came to a shocking and violent end. It is also the story of a clan of whose menfolk guarded a dark secret
from their wives - and everyone else - for three generations. Further it is the chronicle of two dogged police
detectives who exposed the Woodman's sordid secrets to the light of justice.
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From reader reviews:

Ann Lemieux:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free of
charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you
want to consider look for book, may be the guide untitled Family Blood: The True Story of The Yom Kippur
Murders can be great book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Gary Sandler:

Often the book Family Blood: The True Story of The Yom Kippur Murders has a lot of information on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. Tom
makes some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after reading this book.

Gayle Meek:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you personally is Family Blood: The True Story of The Yom Kippur Murders this book
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just
how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand.
Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.

Teresa Obannon:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Family Blood: The True Story of The Yom
Kippur Murders can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
ebooks have than the others?
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