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After long afternoons spent with her great-aunt Yu-i, Pang-Mei, a first-generation Chinese-American, paints
this unforgettable saga of a woman, born in Shanghai at the turn of the century to a well-to-do family, who
continually defied the expectations of her class and culture. 'In China, a woman is nothing,' began Yu-i over
tea and dumplings. 'This is the first lesson I want to give so that you will understand.' Growing up in the
perilous years between the fall of the last Emperor and the Communist Revolution, Yu-i led a life marked by
a series of rebellions that changed the course of her life, including the first and most lasting: her refusal to
have her feet bound. And as Yu-i confides her innermost dreams and demons to her great-niece in this dual
memoir, the deeply textured portrait of a woman's life in China is blended with the very Western story of a
young woman's search for identity and belonging.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Velasquez:

This book untitled Bound Feet and Western Dress a Memoir to be one of several books which best seller in
this year, this is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy
this book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no
reason for you to past this book from your list.

Timothy Rocha:

Bound Feet and Western Dress a Memoir can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article
writer giving his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Bound Feet and
Western Dress a Memoir but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based
confirm resource info that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into brand
new stage of crucial contemplating.

Scott Croft:

This Bound Feet and Western Dress a Memoir is completely new way for you who has intense curiosity to
look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you in it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Bound Feet and
Western Dress a Memoir can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this kind of
book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone,
yes I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them feel drowsy even dizzy
this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book type for your better life
and knowledge.

Michael Sweet:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this
time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word
says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Bound Feet and Western Dress a Memoir can
make you experience more interested to read.
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