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A new edition of Consuelo Vanderbilt Balsan's memoir?the story of the "real" Lady Grantham of Downton
Abbey

Consuelo Vanderbilt was young, beautiful, and heir to a vast fortune. She was also in love with an American
suitor when her mother chose instead for her to marry an English Duke. She sailed to England as the
Duchess of Marlborough in 1895 and took up residence in her new home?Blenheim Palace. She was the real
American heiress who lived long before Downton Abbey's Lady Grantham arrived.

Mme. Balsan is an unsnobbish and amused observer of the intricate hierarchy both upstairs and downstairs
and a revealing witness to the glittering balls, huge weekend parties, and major state occasions she attended
or hosted chronicling her encounters with every important figure of the day?from Queen Victoria, Edward
VII and Queen Alexandra to Tsar Nicholas and the young Winston Churchill.

The Glitter and the Gold is a richly enjoyable memoir is a revealing portrait of a golden age now being
celebrated every week behind the doors of Downton Abbey.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Thompson:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Glitter and the Gold: The
American Duchess---in Her Own Words book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course
the knowledge in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Lizabeth Melgar:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you study a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The The
Glitter and the Gold: The American Duchess---in Her Own Words provide you with new experience in
looking at a book.

Susan Bannister:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This The Glitter and the Gold: The
American Duchess---in Her Own Words is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the
beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy
often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. So there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Vivian Regan:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news. On
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just seeking the The Glitter and the Gold: The American Duchess---in Her Own Words when you desired it?
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