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Master the principles and techniques of multithreaded programming with the Java 8 Concurrency
API

About This Book

Implement concurrent applications using the Java 8 Concurrency API and its new components●

Improve the performance of your applications or process more data at the same time, taking advantage of●

all of your resources.
Construct real-world examples related to machine learning, data mining, image processing, and●

client/server environments

Who This Book Is For

If you are a competent Java developer with a good understanding of concurrency but have no knowledge of
how to effectively implement concurrent programs or use streams to make processes more efficient, then this
book is for you.

What You Will Learn

Design concurrent applications by converting a sequential algorithm into a concurrent one●

Discover how to avoid all the possible problems you can get in concurrent algorithms●

Use the Executor framework to manage concurrent tasks without creating threads●

Extend and modify Executors to adapt their behavior to your needs●

Solve problems using the divide and conquer technique and the Fork/Join framework●

Process massive data sets with parallel streams and Map/Reduce implementation●

Control data-race conditions using concurrent data structures and synchronization mechanisms●

Test and monitor concurrent applications●

In Detail

Concurrency programming allows several large tasks to be divided into smaller sub-tasks, which are further
processed as individual tasks that run in parallel. All the sub-tasks are combined together once the required
results are achieved; they are then merged to get the final output. The whole process is very complex. This
process goes from the design of concurrent algorithms to the testing phase where concurrent applications
need extra attention. Java includes a comprehensive API with a lot of ready-to-use components to implement
powerful concurrency applications in an easy way, but with a high flexibility to adapt these components to
your needs.

The book starts with a full description of design principles of concurrent applications and how to parallelize
a sequential algorithm. We'll show you how to use all the components of the Java Concurrency API from
basics to the most advanced techniques to implement them in powerful concurrency applications in Java.



You will be using real-world examples of complex algorithms related to machine learning, data mining,
natural language processing, image processing in client / server environments. Next, you will learn how to
use the most important components of the Java 8 Concurrency API: the Executor framework to execute
multiple tasks in your applications, the phaser class to implement concurrent tasks divided into phases, and
the Fork/Join framework to implement concurrent tasks that can be split into smaller problems (using the
divide and conquer technique). Toward the end, we will cover the new inclusions in Java 8 API, the Map and
Reduce model, and the Map and Collect model. The book will also teach you about the data structures and
synchronization utilities to avoid data-race conditions and other critical problems. Finally, the book ends
with a detailed description of the tools and techniques that you can use to test a Java concurrent application.

Style and approach

A complete guide implementing real-world examples with algorithms related to machine learning, data
mining, and natural language processing in client/server environments. All the examples are explained in a
step-by-step approach.
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From reader reviews:

Kenny Hardy:

Within other case, little people like to read book Mastering Concurrency Programming with Java 8. You can
choose the best book if you love reading a book. Providing we know about how is important some sort of
book Mastering Concurrency Programming with Java 8. You can add information and of course you can
around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can understand everything!
From your country till foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing
you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet product. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's go through.

Sheila Rivera:

The reserve untitled Mastering Concurrency Programming with Java 8 is the reserve that recommended to
you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to anyone. The language
that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of study when write
the book, and so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book
of Mastering Concurrency Programming with Java 8 from the publisher to make you considerably more
enjoy free time.

Marjorie Ishee:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking Mastering Concurrency
Programming with Java 8 that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book.
Reading practice all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world considerably better
then how they react towards the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who
want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Mastering Concurrency Programming with Java 8
become your own starter.

Ronald Kleiman:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Mastering Concurrency
Programming with Java 8 which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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