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In 2009, at the peak of the financial crisis, AIG - the American insurance behemoth - was sinking fast. It was
the peg upon which the nation hung its ire and resentment during the financial crisis: the pinnacle of Wall
Street arrogance and greed. When Bob Benmosche climbed aboard as CEO, it was widely assumed that he
would go down with his ship. In mere months, he turned things around, pulling AIG from the brink of
financial collapse and restoring its profitability. Before three years were up, AIG had fully repaid its
staggering debt to the U.S. government - with interest.

Good for the Money is an unyielding leader's memoir of a career spent fixing companies through thoughtful,
unconventional strategy. With his brash, no-holds-barred approach to the job, Benmosche restored AIG's
employee morale and good name. His is a story of perseverance, told with refreshing irreverence in
unpretentious terms.

Called "an American hero" by Andrew Ross Sorkin, author of Too Big to Fail, Benmosche was a self-made
man who never forgot what life is like for the nation's 99-percent; again and again, he pushed back against
obstinate colleagues to salvage American jobs and industry. Good for the Money affords you a front-row seat
for Benmosche's heated battles with major players from Geithner to Obama to Cuomo, and offers
incomparable lessons in leadership from the legendary CEO who changed the way Wall Street does business.
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From reader reviews:

Herbert Haubrich:

The book Good for the Money: My Fight to Pay Back America make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting
stress or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading through a book Good for the
Money: My Fight to Pay Back America to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add
your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if
you like available and read a publication Good for the Money: My Fight to Pay Back America. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about
this publication?

John Barrow:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Good for the Money: My Fight to
Pay Back America book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a
book.

Minerva Garrison:

The reason why? Because this Good for the Money: My Fight to Pay Back America is an unordinary book
that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with the secret this
inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such remarkable way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book
will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your talent and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Patrice Eubanks:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
read a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The Good for the Money: My Fight to Pay Back America will give you new experience in
looking at a book.
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