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We know what you’re thinking. You’ve heard about AppleScript. You’ve heard that it can do amazing
things. You’ve heard that it can automate away the tiring, redundant, repetitive tasks you do with the
computer.

All true. But you’re not sure about what’s involved with using it. Is it difficult? Is it programming? After all,
you’re just a better-than average computer user. You know what you know, and your expertise serves you
pretty well. But recently you’ve reached the point of asking yourself “Is there a better way?” The answer is
“Yes.”

And relax, you just got lucky. This book is for you.

If you’ve never written a single line of computer code—this book is for you. If the most technical thing you
do on the computer is calculate a column in Excel—this book is for you. If you’re tired of doing the same
thing over and over—this book is for you.

It’s about being motivated to explore, understand, and take advantage of the tools you already own.
AppleScript is free—the only price for its use is your desire to finally sit down and take a few moments to
absorb and activate its magic.

This book starts at square one and walks you through the process of understanding and writing
AppleScript—step by step, one concept at a time—until you find yourself suddenly creating powerful and
useful automated solutions. And the lessons in this book are based on a decade of experience teaching hands-
on classes to folks just like you. You can do this. You can become Master of your Computer Universe!

Still don’t believe us? Open the first chapter and start reading. You’ll see.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Bosarge:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to reading a
book. The book Apple Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 it is very good to read. There are a lot of
individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not
have enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this
book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book features high quality.

Sherry Clark:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Apple
Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word
written in a e-book then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get previous
to. The Apple Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 giving you yet another experience more than blown away
the mind but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this era. So now let us demonstrate the
relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning an
activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Juana Houck:

Apple Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We recommend
that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in language,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to
place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Apple Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 yet
doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource facts that maybe
you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
contemplating.

Clyde Okane:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information quicker
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended for
your requirements is Apple Training Series: AppleScript 1-2-3 this book consist a lot of the information with
the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up.



The terminology styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.
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