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When Ellery moved to New York with her boyfriend, she thought they’d live happily ever after in their small
New York apartment. She never thought he’d pack his bags and leave because he “needed space.”

With her newfound single status and fear of being alone, Ellery buries herself in her artwork and paintings
until one night she helps a mysterious intoxicated stranger get home safely. Little did she know the
mysterious stranger is none other than CEO and millionaire Connor Black. After finding Ellery in his kitchen
the next morning and assuming she broke his #1 rule about sleepovers, he becomes intrigued, not only by her
stubbornness and defiance, but by her kindness.

Connor Black, emotionally dead and damaged, that stemmed from a personal tragedy, made a vow to never
love or fall in love with a woman, until Ellery Lane walked into his life by accident. After she opens up and
shows him her world, Connor starts to feel emotions and feelings he never knew existed. Despite the rumors
and warnings regarding Connor Black and his use and misuse of women, Ellery finds herself being drawn
into his world.

Ellery knows they can never be together because she is harboring a deep secret that could destroy Connor
emotionally forever.

Join Connor and Ellery as they embark on a journey of courage, love and strength. Will it be enough to save
them?

**18+ For adult situations and language**
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From reader reviews:

Gary Ackley:

This Forever Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a
successful person, why. The key reason why of this Forever Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) can be one of
the great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you with
information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
all over the place and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this
Forever Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich
vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and
luxuriate in reading.

Karen Wilson:

The book with title Forever Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) posesses a lot of information that you can study
it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new expertise the information that
exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to
know how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you in new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Margaret Walker:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Forever Black (Forever Trilogy
Book 1) that give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice all over
the world can be said as the method for people to know world better then how they react in the direction of
the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you
who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you can pick Forever Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) become your current starter.

Donald Pate:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family
or just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere?
It fine you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Forever
Black (Forever Trilogy Book 1) which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
see.
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