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Matisse, Picasso, Hockney—they may not have been from the same period, but they all painted still lifes of
food. And they are not alone. Andy Warhol painted soup cans, Claes Oldenburg sculpted an ice cream cone
on the top of a building in Cologne, Jack Kerouac’s Sal ate apple pie across the country, and Truman Capote
served chicken hash at the Black and White Ball. Food has always played a role in art, but how well and
what did the artists themselves eat? Exploring a panoply of artworks of food, cooking, and eating from
Europe and the Americas, The Modern Art Cookbook opens a window into the lives of artists, writers, and
poets in the kitchen and the studio throughout the twentieth century and beyond.
 
From the early moderns to the impressionists; from symbolists to cubists and surrealists; from the Beats to
the abstractionists of the New York School, Mary Ann Caws surveys how artists and writers have eaten,
cooked, and depicted food. She examines the parallels between the art of cuisine and the visual arts and
literature, using artworks, diaries, novels, letters, and poems to illuminate the significance of particular
ingredients and dishes in the lives of the world’s greatest artists. In between, she supplies numerous recipes
from these artists—including Ezra Pound’s poetic eggs, Cézanne’s baked tomatoes, and Monet’s
madeleines—alongside one hundred color illustrations and thought-provoking selections from both poetry
and prose. A joyous and illuminating guide to the art of food, The Modern Art Cookbook is a feast for the
mind as well as the palate.
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From reader reviews:

Kristin Todd:

The e-book untitled The Modern Art Cookbook is the publication that recommended to you to read. You can
see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of research when write the book,
so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of The
Modern Art Cookbook from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Michael Lucius:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Modern Art Cookbook,
you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it?
Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Herlinda Jerkins:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The The Modern Art Cookbook offer you a new experience in examining a book.

Bernie Watts:

Guide is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. By
book The Modern Art Cookbook we can have more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? For being
creative person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't
become doubt to change your life with this book The Modern Art Cookbook. You can more appealing than
now.
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