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I am American contralto, psalmist, songwriter and recording artist. My mission is to help millions of people
fulfill their dream to make a positive, profound and permanent difference in the lives of people around the
world.
In 2006, I documented my calling and correspondence to the Queen of Gospel, Albertina Walker who gave
her life changing advice; I call them the 3S ("Sing, Study God's Word, Support Gospel Music".) In that same
year, Gospel Heritage Music Conference, I was a student in Bishop Walter Hawkins' Workshop who
instructions were "to value the gift God gives you. The same value you put on the gift God give you will
determine how high the gift will take you" My first song, "In My Jesus Name" was recorded by a local
production company and in 2009 remix and used on live recording called "New Day" Abundant Living
Family Church Christmas DVD/CD. http://www.youtube.com/dupontcares#p/a/u/2/YJEKGo4Be_c This
song received great review from Ken Reynolds www.kenreynolds.com/
Ken Reynolds of Integrity Records said "This is a great song"
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From reader reviews:

Michael Bradley:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be consider when
those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then
you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen in you if you take In My Jesus Name Song Book as the daily resource information.

Lawrence Caulfield:

The e-book with title In My Jesus Name Song Book posesses a lot of information that you can learn it. You
can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book exist new expertise the information that
exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how
the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization.
You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Jeannette Villalobos:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all
day long to reading a publication. The book In My Jesus Name Song Book it is extremely good to read.
There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did not
have enough space to develop this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read
this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

Nolan Russell:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this In My Jesus Name Song Book book
written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by anyone
who also read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for
eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism In My Jesus Name Song Book as good book not only by
the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its deal with, so
do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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