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Dana is definitely not the kind of girl to be living in the dump of a wilderness lodge she finds herself
waitressing in. But when Craig, the sexy cop who’s handling the murder case where she’s a witness, suggests
it—it seems like a good idea. Now she’s got no BMW, no shopping and an assortment of hairy Alaskan men
who definitely belong in a run-down old lodge. Her exciting visits from Craig are getting less exciting, and
the lodge owner, Jason, is quickly moving from grouchy and judgmental, to funny, smart and unexpectedly
complex. Jason knows exactly the type of girl Dana is—beautiful, spoiled, and high maintenance. She’s
everything that hurt him in the past, and why he now lives as far away from city life as he can manage. If he
wasn’t so hard-up for help, he would have never said yes to his friend, Craig. Despite his reservations, Dana
becomes the perfect antidote to everything in his life—both his disaster of a divorce and precocious little
sister who shows up on his doorstep. Jason realizes he’s falling for Dana too late to stop it, or even slow it
down. As the trial approaches, Dana knows it’s time to move on with her life—but is her life back in the city
she left or with a guy she never meant to fall for?
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From reader reviews:

Steven Stockton:

The book Falling can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we
leave the great thing like a book Falling? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one
aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together
with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book Falling has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Roderick Grubb:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Falling book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You
will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving even decrease
the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer associated with Falling content conveys the thought
easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Falling is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Gertrude Ponder:

In this particular era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are
more precious than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of
several books in the top record in your reading list is usually Falling. This book which is qualified as The
Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking right up and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.

Mario Davis:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This book Falling was filled about science. Spend your time to add your knowledge
about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading the book. If
you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like today,
many ways to get book you wanted.
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