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BONUS: This edition includes an excerpt from Karin Slaughter's Unseen.

“Brilliant plotting, relentless suspense,” raved the Washington Post. “A new synonym for terror,” crowned
the Detroit Free Press.  The critics agree: no one writes suspense like Karin Slaughter, whose thrillers
featuring medical examiner Sara Linton and her ex-husband, police chief Jeffrey Tolliver, have propelled her
to the top of bestseller lists the world over. Now Slaughter fuses her unmatched grasp of forensic science and
a mastery of complex relationships in a riveting tale of faith, doubt, and murder.

The victim was buried alive in the Georgia woods—then killed in a horrifying fashion. When Sara Linton
and Jeffrey Tolliver stumble upon the body, both become consumed with finding out who killed the pretty,
impeccably dressed young woman. And for Sara and Jeffrey, a harrowing journey begins, one that will test
their own turbulent relationship and draw dozens of lives into the case.

Lena Adams is one of them. A Grant County detective for years, she has her own reasons for being drawn to
this case and a fierce drive to see justice done. For these three people, who have each seen the darkest side of
human nature, the body of the murdered girl is but the first in a series of shocking and sordid revelations.

Now, as Jeffrey and Sara narrow the field of suspects, they must confront their own doubts and indiscretions,
while Lena Adams sees herself reflected in the frightened eyes of a battered woman who may be the key
figure in the case. As Faithless builds to a stunning and unforgettable climax, Karin Slaughter masterfully
brings together strands of interlocking lives, family secrets, and hidden passions with one astounding truth:
the identity of a killer who is more evil and dangerous than anyone could have guessed.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Rinehart:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need
more time to be learn. Faithless (Grant County Book 5) can be your answer as it can be read by a person who
have those short free time problems.

Joyce Cassady:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just telling
lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Faithless (Grant County Book 5) can be the respond to,
oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time by reading in
this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Sherry Clark:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you
might have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Faithless (Grant County Book 5) can give you
a lot of friends because by you investigating this one book you have issue that they don't and make you more
like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that maybe your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than other make you to be great men
and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have Faithless (Grant County Book 5).

Elizabeth Sherer:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but also novel and Faithless (Grant County Book 5) or even others
sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are helping them
to include their knowledge. In other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Faithless (Grant
County Book 5) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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