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From New York Times bestselling author Mariah Stewart comes a novel of sexy romantic suspense for
fans of Nora Roberts, Catherine Coulter, and Karen Robards.

After Ann Nolan, a California beat cop, adopts the daughter of a notorious drug dealer, the ruthless father
vows to take back his only child. In response, Ann flees across the country, changes her name, and starts a
new life as an investigator for the Mercy Street Foundation, the billionaire-endowed organization dedicated
to finding missing persons. As Emme Caldwell, she takes the lead on the Foundation's first case: Nineteen-
year-old Belinda Hudson disappeared from her sorority house leaving behind only one cryptic clue.
Retracing the vanished student's steps leads Emme to Heaven's Gate, a fertility clinic, and the mysterious
Donor 1735.

Belinda's legal guardian, Nick Perone, is determined to shadow Emme's every move as she searches for his
niece. But the closer Emme gets to Donor 1735 and the chilling truth, the more apparent it becomes that she's
escaped one dangerous man only to run head-on into another-one who's far more determined and every bit as
deadly.
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From reader reviews:

Sam Holmes:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel. You can choose the
best book if you love reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book Cry Mercy: A
Mercy Street Novel. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely
right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you can know that. In this
era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it
when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Johnny Powers:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel
guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still doubt Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel as good
book not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book
by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading
through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Kristine Toomey:

This Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who have always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can declare no rambling
sentences within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core information with lovely delivering sentences.
Having Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this
reserve already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt
which?

Allen Green:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
had been exactly added. This e-book Cry Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel was filled concerning science. Spend
your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct
feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to
read a book. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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