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Long before there were e-mail emoticons for love hearts and flirtatious text messages and photos sent via cell
phone satellite, one had to actually try to articulate feelings of love and desire in real words and sentences.
The love letter these days often seems like a lost art form, when even those of us who might wish to enclose
sentiments in an envelope can turn to the assistance of Hallmark cards. But love letters are not just the made-
up stuff of novels; once upon a time handwritten letters facilitated some of the most intimate exchanges
between lovers.
 
This beautiful book from the British Library celebrates two thousand years of love letter history, from
ancient Egypt to the present day. Included here are facsimile reproductions of twenty-five letters, which are
fully transcribed along with engaging commentaries about the correspondents and their circumstances and
portraits of the writers and recipients. Love Letters includes correspondence by figures such as Henry VIII,
Charles Dickens, Charlotte Brontë, Admiral Nelson, Oscar Wilde, and Mervyn Peake. The words of love
letters allow us insights into the private relationships of people across centuries, cultures, and continents, and
the original manuscripts of such letters grant the reader a direct connection with the author of such personal
words.
 
A perfect gift for any beloved, this charming book may inspire many to pick up a pen and record some
passionate missives of their own.
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From reader reviews:

Warren Damron:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or maybe goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you will need this Love Letters.

Jesus Gilbert:

The reserve untitled Love Letters is the e-book that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of
the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to explained their ideas
are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the information that
they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Love Letters from the
publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Calvin Fischer:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you is Love Letters this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this
world now. That book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use for
explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when he makes this book. This is why
this book acceptable all of you.

Dawn Nelson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got learners? We believe that that question was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update in relation to something by book. Different categories
of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually Love Letters.
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